[2020] FWCA 232

DECISION

Fair Work Act 2009
s.185—Enterprise agreement

Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation T/A Tasmanian Aboriginal Centre
(AG2019/4669)

TASMANIAN ABORIGINAL CORPORATION ENTERPRISE
AGREEMENT 2020

Social, community, home care and disability services

DEPUTY PRESIDENT MASSON MELBOURNE, 16 JANUARY 2020

Application for approval of the Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation Enterprise Agreement
2020.

[1] An application has been made for approval of an enterprise agreement known as the
Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation Enterprise Agreement 2020 (the Agreement). The
application was made pursuant to s.185 of the Fair Work Act 2009 (the Act). It has been made
by Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation T/A Tasmanian Aboriginal Centre. The Agreement is a
single enterprise agreement.

[2] The Employer has provided written undertakings. A copy of the undertakings is
attached in Annexure A. I am satisfied that the undertakings will not cause financial detriment
to any employee covered by the Agreement and that the undertakings will not result in
substantial changes to the Agreement. The undertakings are taken to be a term of the
agreement.

[3] Subject to the undertakings referred to above, I am satisfied that each of the
requirements of ss.186, 187, 188 and 190 as are relevant to this application for approval have
been met.

(4] The Agreement lodged contained a formatting error at clause 15 — remuneration. On
12 December 2019, the Applicant filed an amended page of the Agreement pursuant to s.586
of the Act. I am satisfied that the correction should be made and that it is appropriate to do so
pursuant to s.586 of the Act.

[S] The Australian Nursing and Midwifery Federation and the Australian Municipal,
Administrative, Clerical and Services Union being bargaining representatives for the
Agreement, have given notice under s.183 of the Act that they want the Agreement to cover
them. In accordance with s.201(2) I note that the Agreement covers the organisations.



[2020] FWCA 232

[6] The Agreement is approved and, in accordance with s.54 of the Act, will operate from
23 January 2020. The nominal expiry date of the Agreement is 30 June 2023.

DEPUTY PRESIDENT

Printed by authority of the Commonwealth Government Printer

<AES506778 PR715955>



[2020] FWCA 232

Annexure A

UNDERTAKINGS

IN THE FAIR WORK COMMISSION

FWC Matter No.: AG2019/4669

Applicant:

Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation

Section 185 — Application for approval of a single enterprise agreement
Undertaking- Section 190

I, Heather Sculthorpe, Chief Executive Officer for the Tasmanian Aboriginal
Corporation give the following undertakings with respect to the Tasmanian Aboriginal
Corporation Enterprise Agreement 2020 ("the Agreement"):

1. I have the authority given to me by Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation to provide
this undertaking in relation to the application before the Fair Work Commission.

2. Replace clause 15.2 BASE SALARY TABLE, with Schedule A, BASE SALARY TABLE.

3. For the purpose of clause 15.1 the following will be included:
(f) On the first full pay period on or after 1 February 2020, employees currently
employed on level 1.1 will be reclassified to level 1.3.

4. Replace clause 15.9 with the below:
15.9
(a) Unless otherwise specified in clause 15.9(b) the wages (and related terms and
conditions) of the relevant Award apply to Apprentices and/or Trainees.
(b) The Apprentice and or Trainee is entitled to
(i) superannuation pursuant to clause 17 and
(ii) work ordinary hours provided for in clause 19 and
(iii) personal leave pursuant to clause 24.2,

5. In clause 23.2(a) of the Agreement delete the words "145 hours [20 days] Annual
Leave" and insert the words "4 weeks of paid annual leave"

6. For the purpose of clause 23.2 the following will be included:
(f) To remove all doubt, employees are entitled to no less annual leave than what is
required under the NES.

7. In clause 24.2(a) of the Agreement delete the words "108.75 hours (fifteen days)"
and insert the words "15 days"



[2020] FWCA 232



Schedule A:

152 BASE SATARY TAELE

[2020] FWCA 232

CURRENT | 2020 (2.25% 2021 (2.25% 2022 (2.25%
increase on the | increase on the increase on the
Classification first full pay first finll pay first full pay
Level period on or period on or after | period on or
after 1 1 February) after 1 Febmary)
Febmary)
TAC Level 1
1.1 $44 511 $44.191 $45.185 $46.202
1.2 $45.007 $44.830 $45.839 $46.870
1.3 $45.726 $45,512 546,536 547,583
1.4 $46.357 $46.112 $47.150 $48.211
1.5 e 546,755 $47.807 $48.883
1.6 e $47. 400 $48.467 $40.558
TAC Level 2
21 $48.214 $49.200 550,408 $51.542
22 $49.832 $50,953 $52.099 $33.271
23 $51.182 $52.334 £53,512 $54.716
24 $53.287 $53,852 $55.064 536.303
25 e $55.370 $56,616 $57.890
TACTevel 3
31 $54.564 $55,792 £57.047 $38.331
32 $56.064 $37.325 $58.,615 $59.034
33 $57.537 $58.832 $60.156 561.510
34 $50.030 $60,358 $61.716 $63.105
3.5 $60.504 $61.865 $63.257 564,680
TACTevel 4
4.1 $62.143 563,541 $64.971 566,433
43 $63.750 565.104 $66.661 $68.161
43 $65.382 $66.853 $68.357 $69.895
4.4 $67.074 568,583 570,126 £71.704
TAC Level 5
5.1 $60.264 $70.822 $72.415 $74.044




[2020] FWCA 232

5.2 $71.467 §73.075 £74.719 $76.400
5.3 $73.324 574974 $76.661 578,386
54 $75.206 $76.898 £78.628 $80.397
TAC Tevel 6
6.1 $77.258 $78.996 $80.773 $82.590
6.2 $70.673 581.466 £83.299 585173
6.3 $81.920 $83.763 £85.648 587,575
6.4 $83.438 585315 $87.235 589,198
TACTevel 7
71 $85.516 587,440 $80.407 501 419
1.2 $88.467 $00.458 £02.493 504574
73 $92 298 $94.375 £96.498 $938.669
7.4 $96.998 $00.180 £101.412 5103694
TACTevel 8
81 $102,726 $103,037 $107.400 1093817
8.2 $106.715 109,116 £111,571 114,081
23 $110,704 5113195 £115,742 5118346
TACTevel 9
91 $115.862 5118469 $121,135 5123 861
02 $121922 5124 665 £127 470 $130.338
03 $127.980 5130860 £133.804 5136815
TAC TLevel 10
10.1 $134.284 5137305 5140394 5143553
10.2 $141.909 5145102 £148 367 5151705
10.3 $151.524 5154933 £158 419 5161 983




Note - this agreement is to be read together with an undertaking given by the
employer. The undertaking is taken to be a term of the agreement. A copy of it
can be found at the end of the agreement.



kirton
Undertaking























































































































UNDERTAKINGS

IN THE FAIR WORK COMMISSION

FWC Matter No.: AG2019/4669

Applicant:

Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation

Section 185 — Application for approval of a single enterprise agreement
Undertaking- Section 190

I, Heather Sculthorpe, Chief Executive Officer for the Tasmanian Aboriginal
Corporation give the following undertakings with respect to the Tasmanian Aboriginal
Corporation Enterprise Agreement 2020 ("the Agreement"):

1. I have the authority given to me by Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation to provide
this undertaking in relation to the application before the Fair Work Commission.

2. Replace clause 15.2 BASE SALARY TABLE, with Schedule A, BASE SALARY TABLE.

3. For the purpose of clause 15.1 the following will be included:
(f) On the first full pay period on or after 1 February 2020, employees currently
employed on level 1.1 will be reclassified to level 1.3.

4. Replace clause 15.9 with the below:
15.9
(a) Unless otherwise specified in clause 15.9(b) the wages (and related terms and
conditions) of the relevant Award apply to Apprentices and/or Trainees.
(b) The Apprentice and or Trainee is entitled to
(i) superannuation pursuant to clause 17 and
(ii) work ordinary hours provided for in clause 19 and
(iii) personal leave pursuant to clause 24.2.

5. In clause 23.2(a) of the Agreement delete the words "145 hours [20 days] Annual
Leave" and insert the words "4 weeks of paid annual leave"

6. For the purpose of clause 23.2 the following will be included:
(f) To remove all doubt, employees are entitled to no less annual leave than what is
required under the NES.

7. In clause 24.2(a) of the Agreement delete the words "108.75 hours (fifteen days)"
and insert the words "15 days"



8. In Clause 24.1(b) of the Agreement, insert after the words "immediate family," the
words "or a member of the employee's household,".

9. Delete clause 30.3.

10. In clause 10.4 of the Agreement delete the number "3" and insert the number "4"
so that it reads 4 consecutive hours on any work day.

11. Delete clause 18.1(c).

These undertakings are provided on the basis of issues raised by the Fair Work
Commission in the application before the Fair Work Commission.

Heather Sculthorpe

Chief Executive Officer
Tasmanian Aboriginal Corporation

et

Signature

Date: 10/1/2020



Schedule A:

152 BASE SALARY TABLE

CURRENT | 2020 (2.25% 2021 (2.25% 2022 (2.25%
increase on the increase on the increase on the
Classification first full pay first full pay first full pay
Level period on or period on or after | period on or
after 1 1 February) after 1 February)
February)
TAC Level 1
1.1 $44,511 $44,191 $45,185 $46,202
1.2 $45,097 $44,830 $45,839 $46,870
1.3 $45,726 $45,512 $46,536 $47,583
1.4 $46,357 $46,112 $47,150 $48,211
I $46,755 $47,807 $48,883
16 | e $47,400 $48,467 $49,558
TAC Level 2
2.1 $48,214 $49,299 $50,408 $51,542
2.2 $49,832 $50,953 $52,099 $53,271
2.3 $51,182 $52,334 $53,512 $54,716
2.4 $53,287 $53,852 $55,064 $56,303
A s $55,370 $56,616 $57,890
TAC Level 3
3.1 $54,564 $55,792 $57,047 $58,331
3.2 $56,064 $57,325 $58,615 $59,934
3.3 $57,537 $58,832 $60,156 $61,510
3.4 $59,030 $60,358 $61,716 $63,105
3.5 $60,504 $61,865 $63,257 $64,680
TAC Level 4
4.1 $62,143 $63,541 $64,971 $66,433
4.2 $63,759 $65,194 $66,661 $68,161
4.3 $65,382 $66,853 $68,357 $69,895
4.4 $67,074 $68,583 $70,126 $71,704
TAC Level 5
5.1 $69,264 $70,822 $72,415 $74,044




5.2 $71,467 $73,075 $74,719 $76,400
53 $73,324 $74,974 $76,661 $78,386
5.4 $75,206 $76,898 $78,628 $80,397
TAC Level 6
6.1 $77,258 $78,996 $80,773 $82,590
6.2 $79,673 $81,466 $83,299 $85,173
6.3 $81,920 $83,763 $85,648 $87,575
6.4 $83,438 $85,315 $87,235 $89,198
TAC Level 7
7.1 $85,516 $87,440 $89,407 $91,419
7.2 $88,467 $90,458 $92,493 $94,574
7.3 $92,298 $94,375 $96,498 $98,669
7.4 $96,998 $99,180 $101,412 $103,694
TAC Level 8
8.1 $102,726 $105,037 $107,400 $109,817
8.2 $106,715 $109,116 $111,571 $114,081
8.3 $110,704 $113,195 $115,742 $118,346
TAC Level 9
9.1 $115,862 $118,469 $121,135 $123,861
9.2 $121,922 $124,665 $127,470 $130,338
9.3 $127,980 $130,860 $133,804 $136,815
TAC Level 10
10.1 $134,284 $137,305 $140,394 $143,553
10.2 $141,909 $145,102 $148,367 $151,705
10.3 $151,524 $154,933 $158,419 $161,983




	15CFBA5C2C5A4C63FB9D6D88B1C9746A16339.docx
	2D5DDEBE112253ADFAAFDE6C9112FA1E16181.pdf

